
Benediction 
This is the God we adore, our faithful, 

unchanging friend. 
 

Who’s love is as great as his power, and 

known neither measure nor end. 
 

Tis Jesus, yes it’s Jesus, the first and the 

last, who’s love will guide us safely 

home. 
 

We’ll praise him for all that has past, 

and trust for what is to come! 
 

Amen 
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Welcome to worship 
 

A word of prayer 
 

Bible Reading 
The Sermon on the Mount 

Matthew 5:1-12 
 

The Message 
 

Benediction 
 

Bible Reading 
When Jesus saw the crowds, he went up the 
mountain, and after he sat down his disciples 
came to him. Then he began to speak, and 
taught them, saying:  
 
“ Blessed are the poor in spirit, for theirs is 
the kingdom of heaven. Blessed are those 
who mourn, for they will be comforted. 
Blessed are the meek, for they will inherit the 
earth. Blessed are those who hunger and 
thirst for righteousness, for they will be filled. 
Blessed are the merciful, for they will receive 
mercy. Blessed are the pure in heart, for they 
will see God. Blessed are the peacemakers, 
for they will be called children of God. 
Blessed are those who are persecuted for 
righteousness’ sake, for theirs is the kingdom 
of heaven. Blessed are you when people re-
vile you and persecute you and utter all kinds 
of evil against you falsely on my account. Re-
joice and be glad, for your reward is great in 
heaven, for in the same way they persecuted 
the prophets who were before you.”  

 

Matthew 5.1-12  
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